T |, S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Gr.5M.-31.Te1.-31.-09032024-252793
CG-DL -E-09032024-252793

TTETIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —ETe 3—S9-Tve (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

grfee F THfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 153] & feeft, AT, W 8, 2024/FT[T 18, 1945
No. 153] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 8, 2024/PHALGUNA 18, 1945
FIAT AT
FAferg==T

7% faeeft, 8 w4, 2024

T, 165(37).—FaiT F¥FTE, Fraar g qfasr [t o gt susy srfafRam, 1948 (1948 =7 46)
T ST 7 % A1 Ofod 91T 3. G Y& AT &7 TF0T Fd g0, HIAAT @I 4907 T61H, 1998 T i< e Fieet
F fero Arferferd &= aaTdt 8, T -
1. wfer AT 3= WTIRW- (1) =0 T T S 918 e a1 Gord (Ferree) T, 2024 21

(2) 7g TSI § THH THTAA T AT FT TG T
2. FHIAAT GTT 497 T, 1998 H,-

(F) T 10 F, IT-UT (1) §, “d9 | THATE 9T5a1 T I “UF AT 955 T SATU;
(@) T 11 H, AT G TETE Teal F T 9T “UE gAY 988 T ST,
@@ Tr129,-
(i)  ST-9%7 (3) |, “IT & TATH” QT[T & T T “Ua g 9768 T S0,
(i)  IT-9T (4) H, ‘T G 7 =1l F T UL “UF gAT 9758 T S0,
[FT. &. 20011/3/2023-F 0w o]
AT, ST HRTHIITH

1715 G1/2024 1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

feoqoft: e =T S ==, 1998 fomiw 5 7T+, 1998 F wear Ar.w.A. 123 (31) F ATeAw F Wi v T off
A7 are ¥ Feterfad gearstt F aregw T genfea & g off-

1. ar.ar.fA. 268 (31), fami® 25 7E, 1998;

2. ar.#1.f. 218 (31), faATE 22 97+, 1999;
3. ar.#T1.f7. 689 (31), famT 29 e, 2000;
4. ar.#1.f. 256 (31), famrE 12 ¥, 2001;
5. arar.fA. 861 (31), faeri 23 799%, 2001;
6. ar.F1.. 16 (31), et 9 strasr, 2002;

7. ar.#1.59. 482 (31), fadi= 8 =T, 2002;
8. ar.#.A. 107 (31), famrs 13 w2a<y, 2003;
9. ar.#1.f. 108 (31), famr 13 w2a<y, 2003;
10. ar.#1.f. 521 (31), faATEw 12 srea, 2004;
1. ar.ar.f. 403, fATF 19 79w, 2004;

12. arar.fA. 154 (31), fa=® 5 774, 20009;

13. ar.#1.13. 348 (=), o= 22 9%, 2009;

14. ar.#1.|. 774 (31), AT 22 e, 20009;
15. ar.ar. . 540 (31), faTF 8 S, 2018;

16. arar.f. 119 (31), 3T 22 W=, 2023; i+
17. .30, 4336 (31), faAT® 04 s<pav, 2023

MINISTRY OF COAL
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 8th March, 2024

G.S.R. 165(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3E read with section 7 of the Coal Mines
Provident Fund and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1948 (46 of 1948), the Central Government hereby makes the
following Scheme further to amend the Coal Mines Pension Scheme, 1998, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This scheme may be called the Coal Mines Pension (Amendment)
Scheme, 2024.

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Coal Mines Pension Scheme, 1998, -

(@) in paragraph 10, in sub-paragraph (1), for the words “three hundred fifty” the words “one thousand” shall
be substituted;

(b) in paragraph 11, for the words “three hundred fifty” the words “one thousand” shall be substituted;
(c) inparagraph 12,-

(i) in sub-paragraph (3), for the words “two hundred and fifty” the words “one thousand” shall be
substituted;

(if) in sub-paragraph (4), for the words “three hundred and twenty” the words “one thousand” shall be
substituted;
[F. No. 20011/3/2023-CMPF]

SANTOSH, Dy. Director General



[¢TRT Hl—=ve 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

Note: The Coal Mines Pension Scheme, 1998 was published vide number G.S.R. 123 (E) dated the 5" March, 1998
and subsequently amended vide the following numbers:-

1. G.S.R. 268 (E), dated the 25™ May, 1998;

2. G.S.R. 218 (E), dated the 22" March, 1999;

3. G.S.R. 689 (E), dated the 29" August, 2000;

4. G.S.R. 256 (E), dated the 12" April, 2001;

5. G.S.R. 861 (E), dated the 23" November, 2001;

6. G.S.R. 16 (E), dated the 9" January, 2002;

7. G.S.R. 482 (E), dated the 8" July, 2002;

8. G.S.R. 107 (E), dated the 13" February, 2003;

9. G.S.R. 108 (E), dated the 13" February, 2003;

10. G.S.R. 521 (E), dated the 12" August, 2004;

11. G.S.R. 403, dated the 19" November, 2004;

12. G.S.R. 154 (E), dated the 5™ March, 2009;

13. G.S.R. 348 (E), dated the 22"™ May, 2009;

14. G.S.R. 774(E), dated the 22" October, 2009;

15. G.S.R. 540(E), dated the 8™ June, 2018;

16. G.S.R. 119(E), dated the 22" February, 2023; and

17. S.0. 4336(E), dated the 4™ October, 2023.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. .., o

KUMAR VERI




		2024-03-09T15:22:03+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




